Summary prepared by CID Group, LLC.

SSD: New High School and Stadium - General Contractor Recap 7/10/2018

GENERAL CONTRACTOR ER Stuebner Skepton Boro Thomas P. Carney
BASE BID

50,867,000 51,985,000 53,100,000 53,598,762
ALTERNATES
1 Future Classroom Space - 5 classrooms shell space 492,000 467,000 492,000 370,000
2 Mezzanine Storage for Wood Shop/overall storage 25,000 44,000 53,000 17,900
3 Provide Zinc Panels ilo of Kynar (Base Bid) No bid No bid 129,000 140,000
4 Turf in Main Stadium w/ Shock pad 620,000 599,000 645,000 600,000
5 Canopy 195,000 198,000 328,500 235,000
6 Green roof at Courtyard 90,000 128,000 150,000 94,000
7 Enhanced Courtyard Design 295,000 235,000 287,000 378,000
8 Construction of Occupiable Space below Home Bleachers 725,000 680,000 762,000 608,000
9 Use of Coventry as Stockpile (50,000) No bid No bid (210,349)
10.1 Terrazzo @ Lobby Floor A 60,000 48,000 65,000 79,000
10.2 Terrazzo @ Cafeteria Floor A 100,000 120,000 106,000 142,000
10.3 Terrazzo @ 1st Floor Corridors 40,000 53,000 42,000 65,000
10.4 Terrazzo @ 2nd and 3rd Floor Corridors 260,000 329,000 279,000 323,000
11 Wood Floor @ Auxilliary Gym 23,000 (28,000) 21,000 27,500
12.1 Upgraded Fencing at Stadium Wall 40,000 16,000 17,000 16,000
12.2 Upgraded Fencing around Running Track 60,000 57,000 60,000 54,000
13 Classroom Card Access 40,000 76,000 119,000 54,000
14 Use of Central Field as Stockpile Area (40,000) (25,000) 77,000 (212,969)
15 Alternate Brick - alternate supplier 735,000 750,000 710,000 756,000
16 Synthetic Turf Alternate (60,000) (100,000) No bid 567,000
17 Aluminum Feeders ilo Copper No bid (1,000) No bid No bid
18 Lightning Protection No bid 5,000 No bid No bid
19 Eliminate Voice/Data Stubups at defined locations No bid (1,000) No bid No bid
20.1 Provide Automated Logic ATC system ilo of Basis of Design No bid (1,000) No bid No bid
20.2 Provide Siemens ATC System ilo of Basis of Design No bid (1,000) No bid No bid
20.3 Provide Johnson Controls ATC System ilo Basis of Design No bid (1,000) No bid No bid
21 Change Classroom Flooring from VCT to LVT 450,000 78,000 82,000 77,700
BID FORMS

Addendums Acknowledged 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5

Non-Collusion
Bid Bond

Qualifications Statement
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Summary prepared by CID Group, LLC.

SSD: New High School and Stadium - General Contractor Recap

GENERAL CONTRACTOR

UNIT PRICES
G-1a Unsuitable On-Site:

G-1b  Unsuitable Off-Site:

G-2 Engineered Fill Off-Site:

G-3 Removal and Disposal of Contaminated Soil
P-1 1" Ball Valve:

p-2 4" Butterfly Valve:

M-1 1" Ball Valve:

M-2 2" Gate Valve:

M-3 3" Butterfly Valve:

M-4 Fire Damper:

M-5 Volume Damper:

M-6 Sprinkler Head:

E-1 Duplex Receptacle and Wiring:

E-2 Data Outlet, Cable & Conduit (Masonry Wall):

E-3 Data Outlet & Cable (Stud Wall):
E-4 Exit Sign:
E-5 Fire Alarm Audio Visual Device Clg. Mounted:

E-6 Fire Alarm Audio Visual Device Wall Mounted:

E-7 Fire Alarm Pull Station:
E-8 Fire Alarm Smoke Detector:
E-9 Fire Alarm Smoke Detector — Duct Mounted:

ER Stuebner

35.00
50.00
60.00
175.00
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a

Skepton

20.00
40.00
45.00
400.00
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a

Boro

10.00
27.00
32.00
69.00
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a

7/10/2018

Thomas P. Carney

10.50
85.00
45.00
75.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
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SSD: New High School and Stadium - Mechanical Contractor Bid Recap

7/10/2018

MECHANICAL CONTRACTOR Boro Developers Guy M. Cooper Myco Mech JBM Mechanical Dolan Mech Inc. AllStates EJ Meloney
BASE BID
8,256,000 9,140,000 9,393,000 9,865,000 10,663,000 11,240,000 14,900,000

ALTERNATES
1 Future Classroom Space - 5 classrooms shell space (18,000) 49,300 49,000 60,000 123,000 80,000 15,000
2 Mezzanine Storage for Wood Shop/overall storage 3,000 2,000 No bid 3,000 6,000 7,000 No bid
3 Provide Zinc Panels ilo of Kynar (Base Bid) No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
4 Turf in Main Stadium w/ Shock pad No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
5 Canopy No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
6 Green roof at Courtyard No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
7 Enhanced Courtyard Design No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
8 Construction of Occupiable Space below Home Bleachers 196,000 84,500 133,000 150,000 109,000 174,000 100,000
9 Use of Coventry as Stockpile No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
10.1 Terrazzo @ Lobby Floor A No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
10.2 Terrazzo @ Cafeteria Floor A No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
10.3 Terrazzo @ 1st Floor Corridors No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
104 Terrazzo @ 2nd and 3rd Floor Corridors No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
11 Wood Floor @ Auxilliary Gym No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
12.1 Upgraded Fencing at Stadium Wall No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
12.2 Upgraded Fencing around Running Track No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
13 Classroom Card Access No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
14 Use of Central Field as Stockpile Area No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
15 Alternate Brick - alternate supplier No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
16 Synthetic Turf Alternate No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
17 Aluminum Feeders ilo Copper No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
18 Lightning Protection No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
19 Eliminate Voice/Data Stubups at defined locations No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
20.1 Provide Automated Logic ATC system ilo of Basis of Design 325,000 130,000 100,000 130,000 1,023,000 265,000 200,000
20.2 Provide Siemens ATC System ilo of Basis of Design 100,000 No bid 300,000 200,000 No bid (70,000) No bid
20.3 Provide Johnson Controls ATC System ilo Basis of Design 100,000 No bid 300,000 200,000 No bid No bid No bid
21 Change Classroom Flooring from VCT to LVT No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
BID FORMS

Addendums Acknowledged 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5

Non-Collusion X X X X X X X

Bid Bond X X X X X X X

Qualifications Statement X X X X X X X
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Summary prepared by CID Group, LLC.

Mechanical Contractor




7/10/2018

SSD: New High School and Stadium - Mechanical Contractor Bid Recap

MECHANICAL CONTRACTOR Boro Developers Guy M. Cooper Myco Mech JBM Mechanical Dolan Mech Inc. AllStates EJ Meloney
UNIT PRICES
G-1a Unsuitable On-Site: 150.00 200.00 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
G-1b Unsuitable Off-Site: 350.00 250.00 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
G-2 Engineered Fill Off-Site: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
G-3 Removal and Disposal of Contaminated Soil n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
P-1 1" Ball Valve: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
P-2 4" Butterfly Valve: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
M-1 1" Ball Valve: 40.00 150.00 92.00 150.00 75.00 120.00 50.00
M-2 2" Gate Valve: 120.00 310.00 299.00 200.00 175.00 193.00 100.00
M-3 3" Butterfly Valve: 230.00 775.00 459.00 300.00 400.00 191.00 150.00
M-4 Fire Damper: 120.00 300.00 225.00 200.00 375.00 500.00 2,000.00
M-5 Volume Damper: 60.00 150.00 200.00 75.00 375.00 350.00 2,000.00
M-6 Sprinkler Head: 450.00 300.00 425.00 300.00 350.00 300.00 450.00
E-1 Duplex Receptacle and Wiring: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-2 Data Outlet, Cable & Conduit (Masonry Wall): n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-3 Data Outlet & Cable (Stud Wall): n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-4 Exit Sign: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-5 Fire Alarm Audio Visual Device Clg. Mounted: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-6 Fire Alarm Audio Visual Device Wall Mounted: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-7 Fire Alarm Pull Station: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-8 Fire Alarm Smoke Detector: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-9 Fire Alarm Smoke Detector — Duct Mounted: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
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SSD: New High School and Stadium - Plumbing Contractor Bid Recap

7/10/2018

PLUMBING CONTRACTOR Stan-Roch Myco Mechanical Jay R Reynolds Inc. Vision Mechanical JBM Mechanical Guy M. Cooper
BASE BID
2,310,000 2,431,000 2,440,000 2,488,000 2,556,000 2,789,100

ALTERNATES
1 Future Classroom Space - 5 classrooms shell space 37,000 60,000 18,300 25,300 30,000 38,000
2 Mezzanine Storage for Wood Shop/overall storage No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
3 Provide Zinc Panels ilo of Kynar (Base Bid) No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
4 Turf in Main Stadium w/ Shock pad No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
5 Canopy No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
6 Green roof at Courtyard No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
7 Enhanced Courtyard Design No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
8 Construction of Occupiable Space below Home Bleachers 155,000 141,000 129,000 149,000 124,000 209,000
9 Use of Coventry as Stockpile No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
10.1 Terrazzo @ Lobby Floor A No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
10.2 Terrazzo @ Cafeteria Floor A No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
10.3 Terrazzo @ 1st Floor Corridors No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
10.4 Terrazzo @ 2nd and 3rd Floor Corridors No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
11 Wood Floor @ Aukxilliary Gym No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
12.1 Upgraded Fencing at Stadium Wall No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
12.2 Upgraded Fencing around Running Track No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
13 Classroom Card Access No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
14 Use of Central Field as Stockpile Area No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
15 Alternate Brick - alternate supplier No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
16 Synthetic Turf Alternate No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
17 Aluminum Feeders ilo Copper No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
18 Lightning Protection No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
19 Eliminate Voice/Data Stubups at defined locations No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
20.1 Provide Automated Logic ATC system ilo of Basis of Design No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
20.2 Provide Siemens ATC System ilo of Basis of Design No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
20.3 Provide Johnson Controls ATC System ilo Basis of Design No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
21 Change Classroom Flooring from VCT to LVT No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
BID FORMS

Addendums Acknowledged 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,4,5

Non-Collusion X X X X X X

Bid Bond X X X X X X

Qualifications Statement X X X X X X

Summary prepared by CID Group, LLC.
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Plumbing Contractor



SSD: New High School and Stadium - Plumbing Contractor Bid Recap

7/10/2018

Summary prepared by CID Group, LLC.

PLUMBING CONTRACTOR Stan-Roch Myco Mechanical Jay R Reynolds Inc. Vision Mechanical JBM Mechanical Guy M. Cooper
UNIT PRICES

G-1a Unsuitable On-Site: n/a n/a 85.00 n/a n/a 150.00
G-1b  Unsuitable Off-Site: n/a n/a 185.00 n/a n/a 250.00
G-2 Engineered Fill Off-Site: n/a n/a 85.00 n/a n/a n/a
G-3 Removal and Disposal of Contaminated Soil n/a n/a 450.00 n/a n/a n/a
P-1 1" Ball Valve: 46.00 100.00 60.00 200.00 60.00 95.00
P-2 4" Butterfly Valve: 460.00 1,266.00 600.00 900.00 525.00 1,180.00
M-1 1" Ball Valve: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
M-2 2" Gate Valve: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
M-3 3" Butterfly Valve: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
M-4 Fire Damper: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
M-5 Volume Damper: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
M-6 Sprinkler Head: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-1 Duplex Receptacle and Wiring: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-2 Data Outlet, Cable & Conduit (Masonry Wall): n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-3 Data Outlet & Cable (Stud Wall): n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-4 Exit Sign: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-5 Fire Alarm Audio Visual Device Clg. Mounted: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-6 Fire Alarm Audio Visual Device Wall Mounted: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-7 Fire Alarm Pull Station: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-8 Fire Alarm Smoke Detector: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-9 Fire Alarm Smoke Detector — Duct Mounted: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
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SSD: New High School and Stadium - Electrical Contractor Bid Recap

7/10/2018

ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR Boro Developers Cyprium Solutions Pagoda Electrical Phillips Bros Wescott McGoldrick Goldhorn Electric HB Frazer
BASE BID
6,450,000 7,200,000 7,889,654 8,469,100 9,276,000 10,515,000 11,700,000 12,866,000

ALTERNATES
1 Future Classroom Space - 5 classrooms shell space 11,000 43,000 35,000 53,000 68,000 19,100 49,000 28,000
2 Mezzanine Storage for Wood Shop/overall storage 1,000 4,000 4,500 5,000 29,000 20,000 4,900 7,700
3 Provide Zinc Panels ilo of Kynar (Base Bid) No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
4 Turf in Main Stadium w/ Shock pad No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
5 Canopy 21,000 38,000 45,500 60,000 60,000 61,000 39,000 33,000
6 Green roof at Courtyard No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
7 Enhanced Courtyard Design No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
8 Construction of Occupiable Space below Home Bleachers 40,000 100,000 71,500 95,000 150,000 38,000 99,000 100,000
9 Use of Coventry as Stockpile No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
10.1 Terrazzo @ Lobby Floor A No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
10.2 Terrazzo @ Cafeteria Floor A No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
10.3 Terrazzo @ 1st Floor Corridors No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
10.4 Terrazzo @ 2nd and 3rd Floor Corridors No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
11 Wood Floor @ Auxilliary Gym No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
12.1 Upgraded Fencing at Stadium Wall No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
12.2 Upgraded Fencing around Running Track No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
13 Classroom Card Access 30,000 60,000 38,743 25,000 77,000 No bid 208,000 206,800
14 Use of Central Field as Stockpile Area No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
15 Alternate Brick - alternate supplier No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
16 Synthetic Turf Alternate No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
17 Aluminum Feeders ilo Copper (120,000) (90,000) (155,000) (85,000) (110,000) (40,000) (55,000) (140,000)
18 Lightning Protection 60,000 63,000 66,500 72,000 76,000 76,000 122,000 133,547
19 Eliminate Voice/Data Stubups at defined locations (32,000) (35,000) (6,000) 2,000 (51,500) 10,000 (21,000) (46,000)
20.1 Provide Automated Logic ATC system ilo of Basis of Design No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
20.2 Provide Siemens ATC System ilo of Basis of Design No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
20.3 Provide Johnson Controls ATC System ilo Basis of Design No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
21 Change Classroom Flooring from VCT to LVT No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
BID FORMS

Addendums Acknowledged 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,45 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,45 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,45 1,2,3,4,5 1,2,3,45

Non-Collusion X X X X X X X X

Bid Bond X x-? X X X X X X

Qualifications Statement X X X X X X X X
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SSD: New High School and Stadium - Electrical Contractor Bid Recap

7/10/2018

ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR Boro Developers Cyprium Solutions Pagoda Electrical Phillips Bros Wescott McGoldrick Goldhorn Electric HB Frazer
UNIT PRICES
G-1a Unsuitable On-Site: 15.00 70.00 10.50 n/a 155.00 n/a n/a n/a
G-1b  Unsuitable Off-Site: 30.00 100.00 1,705.00 n/a 195.00 n/a n/a n/a
G-2 Engineered Fill Off-Site: n/a 70.00 25.05 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
G-3 Removal and Disposal of Contaminated Soil n/a 200.00 33.55 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
P-1 1" Ball Valve: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
P-2 4" Butterfly Valve: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
M-1 1" Ball Valve: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
M-2 2" Gate Valve: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
M-3 3" Butterfly Valve: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
M-4 Fire Damper: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
M-5 Volume Damper: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
M-6 Sprinkler Head: n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
E-1 Duplex Receptacle and Wiring: 100.00 200.00 260.00 250.00 425.00 350.00 315.00 221.00
E-2 Data Outlet, Cable & Conduit (Masonry Wall): 650.00 300.00 320.00 400.00 625.00 380.00 550.00 741.00
E-3 Data Outlet & Cable (Stud Wall): 580.00 300.00 350.00 350.00 590.00 360.00 450.00 634.00
E-4 Exit Sign: 680.00 300.00 350.00 300.00 725.00 350.00 1,200.00 1,000.00
E-5 Fire Alarm Audio Visual Device Clg. Mounted: 155.00 300.00 295.00 150.00 400.00 550.00 550.00 341.00
E-6 Fire Alarm Audio Visual Device Wall Mounted: 210.00 300.00 295.00 175.00 425.00 550.00 600.00 432.00
E-7 Fire Alarm Pull Station: 240.00 300.00 305.00 250.00 450.00 500.00 510.00 540.00
E-8 Fire Alarm Smoke Detector: 165.00 300.00 305.00 200.00 400.00 500.00 530.00 467.00
E-9 Fire Alarm Smoke Detector — Duct Mounted: 505.00 1,000.00 485.00 450.00 975.00 1,200.00 1,300.00 781.00
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Electrical Contractor




